
HUB: Yes HUB: No

Item
 No. Description TxDOT 

SPEC# Qty Units Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

101 Construct TxDOT Standard 5'X4' Cast-In Place, Reinforced 
Concrete Closure Sections, complet and in place. 462 13.2 LF 1,400.00$      18,480.00$    2,536.00$     33,475.20$     

102 Construct TxDOT Standard Spread Footing Retaining Walls, 
complete and in place 423 572 SF 120.00$         68,640.00$    110.00$        62,920.00$     

103 Construct TxDOT Standard Parallel Wingwalls, complete 
and in place 466 2 EA 8,000.00$      16,000.00$    21,617.00$   43,234.00$     

104 Construct Temporary Special Shoring, complete and in 
place 403 632 SF 47.50$           30,020.00$    16.00$          10,112.00$     

105 Furnish & Install TxDOT Metal Beam Guard Fence (Timber 
Post), complete and in place 540 281.3 LF 70.00$           19,687.50$    40.00$          11,250.00$     

106 Furnish & Install TxDOT Single Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 2,000.00$      2,000.00$      4,740.00$     4,740.00$       

107 Furnish & Install TxDOT Downstream Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 1,500.00$      1,500.00$      2,140.00$     2,140.00$       

108 Construct 5” Class B Concrete Mow Strip, complete and in 
place 421 18 CY 600.00$         10,800.00$    1,852.00$     33,336.00$     

110 Traffic Control, work fully performed 1 LS 10,000.00$    10,000.00$    12,439.00$   12,439.00$     

RFB 2022-005 - NEWT PATTERSON CULVERT REPLACEMENT

AWARD

 West Texas Rebar Placers, 
Inc. 

 Humphrey & Morton  
Construction Company, Inc. 

 Dallas, TX  Fort Worth, TX 

SECTION A: RETAINING WALL AND CULVERT ITEMS

GRAND TOTAL 177,127.50$                           213,646.20$                           

Icon Information Consultants and SEMA Construction, Inc. submitted a "no bid"

11/29/2021 1/3/2021
Total Calender Days to Complete 100 60
Earliest Start Date



HUB: No HUB: Yes

Item
 No. Description TxDOT 

SPEC# Qty Units Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

101 Construct TxDOT Standard 5'X4' Cast-In Place, Reinforced 
Concrete Closure Sections, complet and in place. 462 13.2 LF 4,471.82$         59,028.02$      3,000.00$     39,600.00$     

102 Construct TxDOT Standard Spread Footing Retaining Walls, 
complete and in place 423 572 SF 130.25$            74,503.00$      55.00$          31,460.00$     

103 Construct TxDOT Standard Parallel Wingwalls, complete 
and in place 466 2 EA 15,000.00$       30,000.00$      35,000.00$   70,000.00$     

104 Construct Temporary Special Shoring, complete and in 
place 403 632 SF 30.38$              19,200.16$      85.00$          53,720.00$     

105 Furnish & Install TxDOT Metal Beam Guard Fence (Timber 
Post), complete and in place 540 281.3 LF 43.44$              12,217.50$      50.00$          14,062.50$     

106 Furnish & Install TxDOT Single Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 5,093.10$         5,093.10$        2,500.00$     2,500.00$       

107 Furnish & Install TxDOT Downstream Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 2,100.00$         2,100.00$        3,650.00$     3,650.00$       

108 Construct 5” Class B Concrete Mow Strip, complete and in 
place 421 18 CY 872.19$            15,699.42$      650.00$        11,700.00$     

110 Traffic Control, work fully performed 1 LS 2,158.80$         2,158.80$        45,000.00$   45,000.00$     

RFB 2022-005 - NEWT PATTERSON CULVERT REPLACEMENT

 North Rock Construction LLC  FNH Construction LLC 

 Denton, TX  Plano, TX 

220,000.00$                                271,692.50$                           

SECTION A: RETAINING WALL AND CULVERT ITEMS

GRAND TOTAL

Icon Information Consultants and SEMA Construction, Inc. submitted a "no bid"

Total Calender Days to Complete
Earliest Start Date 11/15/2021 12/13/2021

60 120



HUB: No HUB: Yes

Item
 No. Description TxDOT 

SPEC# Qty Units Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

101 Construct TxDOT Standard 5'X4' Cast-In Place, Reinforced 
Concrete Closure Sections, complet and in place. 462 13.2 LF 2,000.00$         26,400.00$      3,500.00$     46,200.00$     

102 Construct TxDOT Standard Spread Footing Retaining Walls, 
complete and in place 423 572 SF 150.00$            85,800.00$      122.00$        69,784.00$     

103 Construct TxDOT Standard Parallel Wingwalls, complete 
and in place 466 2 EA 20,000.00$       40,000.00$      32,000.00$   64,000.00$     

104 Construct Temporary Special Shoring, complete and in 
place 403 632 SF 15.00$              9,480.00$        101.00$        63,832.00$     

105 Furnish & Install TxDOT Metal Beam Guard Fence (Timber 
Post), complete and in place 540 281.3 LF 50.00$              14,062.50$      53.00$          14,906.25$     

106 Furnish & Install TxDOT Single Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 3,500.00$         3,500.00$        2,125.00$     2,125.00$       

107 Furnish & Install TxDOT Downstream Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 5,500.00$         5,500.00$        5,600.00$     5,600.00$       

108 Construct 5” Class B Concrete Mow Strip, complete and in 
place 421 18 CY 1,000.00$         18,000.00$      650.00$        11,700.00$     

110 Traffic Control, work fully performed 1 LS 35,000.00$       35,000.00$      7,300.00$     7,300.00$       

SECTION A: RETAINING WALL AND CULVERT ITEMS

237,742.50$                                285,447.25$                           GRAND TOTAL

 IBCTX, LLC  Urban Infraconstruction 

 Lake Dallas, TX  Fort Worth, TX 

Icon Information Consultants and SEMA Construction, Inc. submitted a "no bid"

RFB 2022-005 - NEWT PATTERSON CULVERT REPLACEMENT

Earliest Start Date
Total Calender Days to Complete 60 75

11/8/2021 11/8/2021



HUB: Yes HUB: No

Item
 No. Description TxDOT 

SPEC# Qty Units Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

101 Construct TxDOT Standard 5'X4' Cast-In Place, Reinforced 
Concrete Closure Sections, complet and in place. 462 13.2 LF 3,500.00$         46,200.00$      1,500.00$     19,800.00$     

102 Construct TxDOT Standard Spread Footing Retaining Walls, 
complete and in place 423 572 SF 187.00$            106,964.00$    100.00$        57,200.00$     

103 Construct TxDOT Standard Parallel Wingwalls, complete 
and in place 466 2 EA 45,000.00$       90,000.00$      21,000.00$   42,000.00$     

104 Construct Temporary Special Shoring, complete and in 
place 403 632 SF 10.00$              6,320.00$        95.00$          60,040.00$     

105 Furnish & Install TxDOT Metal Beam Guard Fence (Timber 
Post), complete and in place 540 281.3 LF 25.00$              7,031.25$        321.00$        90,281.25$     

106 Furnish & Install TxDOT Single Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 1,250.00$         1,250.00$        2,750.00$     2,750.00$       

107 Furnish & Install TxDOT Downstream Guardrail Terminal, 
complete and in place 544 1 EA 2,700.00$         2,700.00$        44,000.00$   44,000.00$     

108 Construct 5” Class B Concrete Mow Strip, complete and in 
place 421 18 CY 700.00$            12,600.00$      400.00$        7,200.00$       

110 Traffic Control, work fully performed 1 LS 50,000.00$       50,000.00$      75,000.00$   75,000.00$     

RFB 2022-005 - NEWT PATTERSON CULVERT REPLACEMENT

 Select Maintenance, LLC  Atkins Bros. Equip. Co., Inc. 

 Euless, TX  Midlothian, TX 

SECTION A: RETAINING WALL AND CULVERT ITEMS

GRAND TOTAL 323,065.25$                                398,271.25$                           

180

Icon Information Consultants and SEMA Construction, Inc. submitted a "no bid"

Earliest Start Date 1/1/2022 11/24/2021
Total Calender Days to Complete 70


	Bid Tab 

