RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program

and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 1 - DWI Education

Amigos and

180 RC DWI Associates ]
Education, LLC Education and Bee Services Inc.
. . MAX. . Farmers Branch, TX
Evaluation Criteria Fort Worth, TX Counseling, Inc.
SCORE ] HUB - No
HUB - No Irving, TX COOP - Yes
COOP - Yes HUB - No
COOP - Yes

Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 7.00 15.00 9.33
Resp‘o‘nsn-/eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 4.00 8.00 6.67
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 4.00 21.00 13.33
References 15 5.00 14.00 8.00
Proposed Cost 30 12.50 23.08 21.43
Total Score 100 32.50 81.08 58.76

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center




RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 1 - DWI Education

North Texas On The Road
Dallas Symposium, Addiction Again d/b/a
MAX Inc. Counseling and |Healthy Mind Body
Evaluation Criteria SCOI‘\;E Plano, TX Education, Inc. and Spirit
HUB - No Fort Worth, TX Irving, TX
COOP - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
COOP - Yes COOP - Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 13.00 11.00 17.00
Resp.o‘nsi\'/eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 6.00 9.00 8.00
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 28 21.67 20.00 22.00
References 15 14.00 9.00 10.00
Proposed Cost 30 25.00 30.00 20.00
Total Score 100 79.67 79.00 77.00

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center



RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 1 - DWI Education

Opportunities Rec_ove.ry Substance Abuse
. Monitoring .

Counseling Center Solutions Guidance and

Evaluation Criteria MAX. Iriz Corporation Edueation, LLC

SCORE | Fort Worth, TX P ’ Fort Worth, TX

Dallas, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
COOP - Yes COOP - Yes COOP - Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 19.00 20.00 15.00
Resp.o'nsi\./eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 9.00 10.00 8.00
Specifications

Proposed Approach and Management 25 23.00 24.33 20.00
References 15 14.00 10.00 3.00
Proposed Cost 30 10.00 16.67 15.00
Total Score 100 75.00 81.00 61.00

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center



RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 1 - DWI Education

The Polo Group,
. . MAX. LLe .
Evaluation Criteria Waxahachie, TX
SCORE
HUB - No
COOP - Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 18.00
Responsiveness to the RFP Requirements and
e i 10 8.67
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 23.00
References 15 5.00
Proposed Cost 30 20.00
Total Score 100 74.67

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center



RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program

and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 2 - DWI Repeat Offender Program

Amigos and

180 RC DWI Associates Bee Services Inc.
MAX Education, LLC Education and Farmers Branch,
Evaluation Criteria SCOI‘\;E Fort Worth, TX Counseling, Inc. X
HUB - No Irving, TX HUB - No
COOP - Yes HUB - No COOP - Yes
COOP - Yes

Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 4.00 15.00 9.33
Resp-o.nsn./eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 4.00 8.00 5.67
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 4.00 20.33 13.33
References 15 5.00 14.00 8.00
Proposed Cost 30 14.42 23.44 27.27
Total Score 100 31.42 80.77 63.60

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center




RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 2 - DWI Repeat Offender Program

Mo Taes Opportunities
Dallas Symposium,|  Addiction ppor
. Counseling Center
MAX Inc. Counseling and Inc
Evaluation Criteria ' Plano, TX Education, Inc. )
SCORE ’ ’
HUB - No Fort Worth, TX F°ﬁl‘1"!’3°_”£fx
COOP - Yes HUB - No COOP - Y
COOP - Yes s
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 13.00 11.00 19.00
Resp_o'nsi\./eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 6.00 9.00 9.00
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 21.67 20.00 23.00
References 15 14.00 9.00 14.00
Proposed Cost 30 25.00 25.00 18.75
Total Score 100 79.67 74.00 83.75

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center



RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 2 - DWI Repeat Offender Program

Recovery
Monitoring Subs_tance RS The Polo Group,
g Guidance and
Solutions . LLC
. . MAX. . Education, LLC .
Evaluation Criteria Corporation Waxahachie, TX
SCORE Fort Worth, TX
Dallas, TX HUB - No HUB - No
HUB - No COOP - Yes COOP - Yes
COOP - Yes i
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 19.67 16.00 18.00
Resp'o'nsi\./eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 9.67 8.00 8.67
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 24.00 20.00 23.00
References 15 10.00 3.00 5.00
Proposed Cost 30 27.78 30.00 25.00
Total Score 100 91.12 77.00 79.67

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center



RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 3 - Drug Offender Education Program

Amigos and

180 RC DWI Abba 4ever Associates
MAX Education, LLC Enterprises, Inc. Education and
Evaluation Criteria SCOR.E Fort Worth, TX Crowley, TX Counseling, Inc.
HUB - No HUB - Yes Irving, TX
COOP - Yes COOP - Yes HUB - No
COOP - Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 4.00 15.00 15.00
Resp.o.nsn./eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 4.00 10.00 8.00
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 4.00 23.00 21.00
References 15 5.00 0.00 14.00
Proposed Cost 30 14.12 24.00 24.00
Total Score 100 31.12 72.00 82.00

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center




RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 3 - Drug Offender Education Program

North Texas
Bee Services Inc. |Dallas Symposium, Addiction
MAX Farmers Branch, Inc. Counseling and
Evaluation Criteria SCOR.E TX Plano, TX Education, Inc.
HUB - No HUB - No Fort Worth, TX
COOP - Yes COOP - Yes HUB - No
COORP - Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 9.33 13.00 11.00
Respp_nsi\(eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 6.67 6.00 9.00
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 13.33 21.67 20.00
References 15 8.00 14.00 9.00
Proposed Cost 30 30.00 30.00 26.67
Total Score 100 67.33 84.67 75.67

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center



RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program

and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 3 - Drug Offender Education Program

i T_he i Opportunities Substance Abuse
Again d/b/a . .
. Counseling Center| Guidance and
Healthy Mind Body .
Evaluation Criteria g and Spirit Ine. Edusation, LLG
SCORE el pTX Fort Worth, TX | Fort Worth, TX
HUBQ_’ No HUB - No HUB - No
COOP - Yes COOP - Yes COOP - Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 17.00 19.00 16.00
Respp_nsi\(eness to the RFP Requirements and 10 8.00 9.00 8.00
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 22.00 23.00 20.00
References 15 10.00 14.00 3.00
Proposed Cost 30 24.00 12.00 24.00
Total Score 100 81.00 77.00 71.00

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center




RFP No. 2022-088, Annual Contract for Offender/Defendant-Paid DWI Education, DWI Repeat Offender Program
and Drug Offender Education Program

SECTION 3 - Drug Offender Education Program

The Polo Group,
. . MAX. LLG .
Evaluation Criteria Waxahachie, TX
SCORE
HUB - No
COOP -Yes
Vendor Qualifications and Experience 20 18.00
Responsiveness to the RFP Requirements and
e 10 8.67
Specifications
Proposed Approach and Management 25 23.00
References 15 5.00
Proposed Cost 30 24.00
Total Score 100 78.67

No bid: Levy's Tutorial and Enrichment Center





