Bid No. 2022-104, PURCHASE OF MORGUE RACKING SYSTEM

AWARD

Phoenix Metal

Products, Inc.

Salam International, Inc.

No bid: AliMed, Inc., TAB Storage and Business Solutions Freeport, NY Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No HUB - No
[tem Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Morgue Rack System, 4 across x 4 high for 16 1 $8,191.00 $8,191.00 - $10,304.00 $10,304.00

1 |Bodies, Mortech Manufacturing #86-129, or approved
equivalent

Mfg. Phoenix Metal Products, Inc. Salam International, Inc.
Part # MMR.4.4.27 90-1030/27-16
Morgue Rack System, 17 across x 4 high for 68 1 $34,811.00 $34,811.00 $43,792.00 $43,792.00
2 |Bodies, Mortech Manufacturing #86-129, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Phoenix Metal Products, Inc. Salam International, Inc.
Part # MMR.17.4.27 90-1030/27-68
Morgue Rack System, 6 across x 4 high for 24 1 $12,286.00 $12,286.00 $15,456.00 $15,456.00
3 |Bodies., Mortech Manufacturing #86-129, or
approved equivalent Mfg. Phoenix Metal Products, Inc. Salam International, Inc.
Part # MMR.6.4.27 90-1030/27-24
Standard Body Tray with Hand Slots, 27" Wide, 108 $528.00 $57,024.00 $574.00 $61,992.00
4 |Mortech Manufacturing #T3626HS-27, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Phoenix Metal Products, Inc. Salam International, Inc.
Part # MCT.100.27.HS 90-0670HS/27
5 Portable Cadaver Scissor Lift with Rollers, Mortech 1 $15,215.00 $15,215.00 $6,995.00 $6,995.00
Manufacturing #M690, or approved equivalent
Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Salam International, Inc.
Part # M690 80-1130




Bid No. 2022-104, PURCHASE OF MORGUE RACKING SYSTEM

Fisher Healthcare

MMCI Acquisition LLC d/b/a Mortech
Manufacturing Company, Inc.

No bid: AliMed, Inc., TAB Storage and Business Solutions Houston, TX
HUB - No Azusa, CA
HUB - No
Item Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Morgue Rack System, 4 across x 4 high for 16 1 $11,515.00 $11,515.00 $11,515.00 $11,515.00
1 |Bodies, Mortech Manufacturing #86-129, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Mortech Manufacturing
Part # 86-129 16 Bodies 86-129
Morgue Rack System, 17 across x 4 high for 68 1 $40,240.00 $40,240.00 $40,240.00 $40,240.00
2 |Bodies, Mortech Manufacturing #86-129, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Mortech Manufacturing
Part # 86-129 68 Bodies 86-129
Morgue Rack System, 6 across x 4 high for 24 1 $16,545.00 $16,545.00 $16,545.00 $16,545.00
3 |Bodies., Mortech Manufacturing #86-129, or
approved equivalent Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Mortech Manufacturing
Part # 86-129 24 Bodies 86-129
Standard Body Tray with Hand Slots, 27" Wide, 108 $715.00 $77,220.00 $715.00 $77,220.00
4 |Mortech Manufacturing #T3626HS-27, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Mortech Manufacturing
Part # T3626HS-27 T3626HS-27
5 Portable Cadaver Scissor Lift with Rollers, Mortech 1 $12,855.00 Y12, paale +12,885.00 $12,855.00
Manufacturing #M690, or approved equivalent
Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Mortech Manufacturing

Part #

M690

M690




Bid No. 2022-104, PURCHASE OF MORGUE RACKING SYSTEM

AWARD
Phoenix Metal Products, Inc. Salam International, Inc.
No bid: AliMed, Inc., TAB Storage and Business Solutions Freeport, NY Foothill Ranch, CA
HUB - No HUB - No
[tem Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Full Roller Pallet Fit 27" Trays, for Hydraulic Lifts, 1 $3,280.00 $3,280.00 $1,075.00 $1,075.00
6 |Mortech Manufacturing #M601H-27, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Phoenix Metal Products, Inc. Salam International, Inc.
Part # MRP.100.27.FR 90-1120
7 |Training Program, if applicable 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 |Freight Charge 1 $5,875.00 $5,875.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00
9 |Installation Fee 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
Total $141,682.00 $157,114.00
Warranty 1 Year 1 Year
Estimated Delivery ARO 60 120




Bid No. 2022-104, PURCHASE OF MORGUE RACKING SYSTEM

. MMCI Acquisition LLC d/b/a Mortech
Fianer Healthears Manufacturing Company, In
No bid: AliMed, Inc., TAB Storage and Business Solutions Houston, TX g -ompany, inc.
HUB - No Azusa, CA
HUB - No
ltem Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Full Roller Pallet Fit 27" Trays, for Hydraulic Lifts, 1 $2,090.00 $2,090.00 $2,090.00 $2,090.00
6 |Mortech Manufacturing #M601H-27, or approved
equivalent Mfg. Mortech Manufacturing Mortech Manufacturing
Part # M601H-27 M601H-27
7 |Training Program, if applicable 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
8 |Freight Charge 1 $17,600.00 $17,600.00 $17,595.00 $17,595.00
9 |Installation Fee 1 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00
Total $189,065.00 $189,060.00
Warranty 1 Year 1 Year
Estimated Delivery ARO 80 75






