RFB 2022-121 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR AMMUNITION

G T Distributors, Inc. IOF Inc.
Austin, TX Dalton Gardens, ID
HUB: No HUB: No
COOP: Yes COOP: Yes
No ltemn Est Qty in Preferred Rounds Price Price Rounds | Price Price
' Rounds Rounds Case Round Case Case Round | Case

Section 1: Duty Ammunition

1 |9mm 124gr +P GDHP 122,000 1,000 1,000 $0.60 | $600.00 No Bid

2 [12ga 9-Pellet 00-Buck Tactical 250 250 250 $0.83 | $207.50 No Bid

3 [.223 62GR Tactical Bonded SP 200 200 200 $1.92 | $384.00 No Bid

4 |45 Auto 230gr GDHP 1,000 1,000 1,000 $0.76 | $760.00 No Bid

5 [.40 S&W 180gr GDHP 8,000 1,000 1,000 $0.69 | $690.00 No Bid

6 [357 SIG 125gr GDHP 1,000 1,000 1,000 $0.68 | $680.00 No Bid

Section 1: Total $3,321.50 No Bid

Section 2: Training Ammunition

1 |.223 Remington 55 gr FMJ Boat Tail 1,000 1,000 500 $0.55 | $275.00 No Bid

2 |9mm Luger 147 gr FMJ Flat Point 362,000 1,000 1,000 $0.60 | $600.00 1000 | $0.38 | $380.00

Section 2: Total $875.00 *
Discount Off List Price, Not Listed 3% | 0%
Grand Total | $4,196.50 | *

No Bid: Precision Delta Corporation
*IOF Inc. was deemed non-responsive for failure to bid on all items as required.
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