
Item Qty Unit Ext

Truck Rental − Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance − Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Rental Collision Insurance − Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Truck Rental − Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Liability Insurance − Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance − Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Truck Rental −Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance − Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Rental Collision Insurance − Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Mileage Charge, per Mile 1 No Bid No Bid

Truck Rental − Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance − Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Rental Collision Insurance − Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Truck Rental − Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Liability Insurance − Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance − Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Truck Rental −Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance − Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid

Rental Collision Insurance − Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Mileage Charge, per Mile 1 No Bid No Bid

 EAN Holdings, LLC - 
Dallas Fort Worth dba 
Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX 75038
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-179 Annual Contract for Rental of Bobtail Trucks

Section 1: 14' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission

 Award 

Section 2: 15' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission

Section Total
Liftgate

Truck Make/Model
Delivery Service

Section Total
Liftgate

Truck Make/Model
Delivery Service

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



Item Qty Unit Ext

 EAN Holdings, LLC - 
Dallas Fort Worth dba 
Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX 75038
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-179 Annual Contract for Rental of Bobtail Trucks

 Award 

Truck Rental − Daily Rental 24 115.00$      2,760.00$      
Liability Insurance − Daily Rental 24 Included Included

Rental Collision Insurance − Daily Rental 24 Included Included
Truck Rental − Weekly Rental 111 690.00$      76,590.00$    

Liability Insurance − Weekly Rental 111 Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance − Weekly Rental 111 Included Included

Truck Rental −Monthly Rental 21 2,760.00$    57,960.00$    
Liability Insurance − Monthly Rental 21 Included Included

Rental Collision Insurance − Monthly Rental 21 Included Included
Mileage Charge, per Mile 29,104 0.14$          4,074.56$      

Truck Rental − Daily Rental 1 145.00$      145.00$         
Liability Insurance − Daily Rental 1 Included Included

Rental Collision Insurance − Daily Rental 1 Included Included
Truck Rental − Weekly Rental 1 870.00$      870.00$         

Liability Insurance − Weekly Rental 1 Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance − Weekly Rental 1 Included Included

Truck Rental −Monthly Rental 1 3,480.00$    3,480.00$      
Liability Insurance − Monthly Rental 1 Included Included

Rental Collision Insurance − Monthly Rental 1 Included Included
Mileage Charge, per Mile 1 14.00$        14.00$           

Section 3: 16' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission

Section 4: 20-25' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission

Section Total
Liftgate

Truck Make/Model
Delivery Service

Section Total
Liftgate

Truck Make/Model
Delivery Service

3,565.14$                            
 Yes 
 Isuzu NPR 2017-2022 
 No 

4,509.00$                            
 Yes 
 Hino, International, 
 No 
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