

RFB 2022-192 Annual Contract for Oil and Lubricants

			Douglass Distributing Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Senergy Petroleum Phoenix, AZ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Brenntag Lubricants, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		The Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		
Item No.	Annual Est. Usage	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
Section 1: Oil and Lubricants			<b>Primary Award</b>		<i>Secondary Award</i>		Alternate Award				
Engine Oil 5W-20 Synthetic Blend											
1	1	Quart	\$ 3.75	\$ 3.75	\$ 4.02	\$ 4.02	\$ 3.75	\$ 3.75	*	\$ 3.87	\$ 3.87
2	9	Drum	\$ 636.35	\$ 1,727.70	\$ 644.05	\$ 1,288.10	\$ 703.40	\$ 1,406.80	*	\$ 590.56	\$ 1,181.12
Engine Oil 5W-30 Synthetic Blend											
3	120	Quart	\$ 3.75	\$ 450.00	\$ 4.02	\$ 482.40	\$ 3.75	\$ 450.00	*	\$ 3.87	\$ 464.40
4	2	Drum	\$ 636.35	\$ 1,727.70	\$ 644.05	\$ 1,288.10	\$ 703.40	\$ 1,406.80	*	\$ 590.56	\$ 1,181.12
Engine Oil 0W-20 Synthetic											
5	48	Quart	\$ 8.05	\$ 386.40	\$ 5.64	\$ 270.72	\$ 6.91	\$ 331.68	*	\$ 5.85	\$ 280.96
6	5	Drum	\$ 1,808.80	\$ 9,044.00	\$ 913.55	\$ 4,567.75	\$ 1,174.25	\$ 5,871.25	*	\$ 784.65	\$ 3,923.27
Engine Oil 10W-30 Heavy Duty (HDEO)											
7	1	Quart	\$ 6.85	\$ 6.85	\$ 5.39	\$ 5.39	\$ 4.85	\$ 4.85	*	\$ 5.10	\$ 5.10
8	3	Drum	\$ 756.25	\$ 2,268.75	\$ 892.10	\$ 2,676.30	\$ 1,014.81	\$ 3,044.43	*	\$ 673.26	\$ 2,019.78
Engine Oil 15W-40 Heavy Duty (HDEO)											
9	4	Drum	\$ 764.50	\$ 3,058.00	\$ 801.90	\$ 3,207.60	\$ 877.20	\$ 3,508.80	*	\$ 731.34	\$ 2,925.35
10	485 Gal	Bulk	\$ 12.30	\$ 5,965.50	\$ 14.29	\$ 6,930.65	\$ 14.97	\$ 7,260.45	*	\$ 11.98	\$ 5,779.90
Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic											
11	5	Pail	\$ 171.29	\$ 685.19	\$ 226.80	\$ 1,134.00	\$ 306.70	\$ 1,533.50	*	\$ 167.01	\$ 835.07
12	2	Keg	\$ 656.90	\$ 1,313.80	\$ 744.00	\$ 1,488.00	\$ 1,012.98	\$ 2,025.96	*	\$ 550.87	\$ 1,101.74
Gear Oil 80W-90 Synthetic											
13	1	Keg	\$ 405.75	\$ 405.75	\$ 374.40	\$ 374.40	\$ 452.44	\$ 452.44	*	\$ 299.66	\$ 299.66
14	1	Drum	\$ 823.68	\$ 823.68	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,499.08	\$ 1,499.08	*	\$ 927.70	\$ 927.70

RFB 2022-192 Annual Contract for Oil and Lubricants

			Douglass Distributing Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Senergy Petroleum Phoenix, AZ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Brenntag Lubricants, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		The Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		
Item No.	Annual Est. Usage	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
Section 1: Oil and Lubricants			<b>Primary Award</b>		<i>Secondary Award</i>		Alternate Award				
Gear Oil 85W-140 Synthetic											
15	1	Pail	\$ 94.45	\$ 94.45	\$ 112.00	\$ 112.00	\$ 246.42	\$ 246.42	*	\$ 103.85	\$ 103.85
16	1	Keg	\$ 258.96	\$ 258.96	\$ 378.00	\$ 378.00	\$ 738.24	\$ 738.24	*	\$ 308.44	\$ 308.44
Grease Multi Purpose EP-2											
17	36	Tube	\$ 4.65	\$ 167.40	\$ 4.77	\$ 171.72	\$ 5.00	\$ 180.00	*	\$ 6.56	\$ 236.17
18	5	Keg	\$ 487.95	\$ 2,439.79	\$ 600.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 625.38	\$ 3,126.90	*	\$ 466.02	\$ 2,330.09
Heating Oil, ISO46											
19	1	Pail	\$ 154.20	\$ 154.20	\$ 115.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 148.00	\$ 148.00	*	No Bid	No Bid
20	2	Drum	\$ 673.75	\$ 1,347.50	\$ 1,192.40	\$ 2,384.80	\$ 1,236.95	\$ 2,473.90	*	No Bid	No Bid
Heating Oil ISO68											
21	5	Pail	\$ 154.20	\$ 771.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 148.00	\$ 740.00	*	No Bid	No Bid
22	5	Drum	\$ 680.65	\$ 3,403.25	\$ 1,192.40	\$ 5,962.00	\$ 1,236.95	\$ 6,184.75	*	No Bid	No Bid
Hydraulic Oil ISO32											
23	1	Pail	\$ 63.10	\$ 63.10	\$ 67.25	\$ 67.25	\$ 77.22	\$ 77.22	*	\$ 77.25	\$ 77.25
24	2	Drum	\$ 569.25	\$ 1,138.50	\$ 660.55	\$ 1,321.10	\$ 810.15	\$ 1,620.30	*	\$ 567.81	\$ 1,135.62
Hydraulic Oil ISO46											
25	1	Drum	\$ 569.25	\$ 569.25	\$ 660.55	\$ 660.55	\$ 810.15	\$ 810.15	*	\$ 604.21	\$ 604.21
26	160 Gal	Bulk	\$ 8.85	\$ 1,416.00	\$ 12.01	\$ 12.01	\$ 13.93	\$ 2,228.80	*	\$ 9.04	\$ 1,446.29
Hydraulic Oil ISO68											
27	5	Pail	\$ 63.10	\$ 315.50	\$ 65.90	\$ 329.50	\$ 77.22	\$ 386.10	*	\$ 59.66	\$ 298.28
28	5	Drum	\$ 569.25	\$ 2,846.25	\$ 660.55	\$ 3,302.75	\$ 810.15	\$ 4,050.75	*	\$ 601.78	\$ 3,008.88

RFB 2022-192 Annual Contract for Oil and Lubricants

			Douglass Distributing Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Senergy Petroleum Phoenix, AZ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Brenntag Lubricants, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		The Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		
Item No.	Annual Est. Usage	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
Section 1: Oil and Lubricants			<b>Primary Award</b>		<i>Secondary Award</i>		Alternate Award				
Transmission Fluid Universal for Automatic Transmissions											
29	60	Quart	\$ 3.85	\$ 231.00	\$ 4.65	\$ 279.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 360.00	*	No Bid	No Bid
30	5	Drum	\$ 598.95	\$ 2,994.75	\$ 836.00	\$ 4,180.00	\$ 1,025.42	\$ 5,127.10	*	\$ 1,692.23	\$ 8,461.16
Transmission Fluid Universal for Manual Transmissions											
31	60	Quart	\$ 3.85	\$ 231.00	\$ 10.26	\$ 615.60	\$ 6.00	\$ 360.00	*	\$ 3.73	\$ 224.06
32	5	Drum	\$ 598.95	\$ 2,994.75	\$ 220.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 1,025.42	\$ 5,127.10	*	\$ 632.20	\$ 3,160.99
Transmission Fluid Chrysler Approved											
33	60	Quart	\$ 4.67	\$ 280.20	\$ 6.13	\$ 367.80	\$ 6.00	\$ 360.00	*	\$ 6.04	\$ 362.25
34	6	Drum	\$ 823.90	\$ 4,943.40	\$ 1,226.50	\$ 7,359.00	\$ 1,025.42	\$ 6,152.52	*	\$ 856.14	\$ 4,280.60
Transmission Fluid Ford Approved											
35	60	Quart	\$ 4.67	\$ 280.20	\$ 6.13	\$ 367.80	\$ 6.00	\$ 360.00	*	\$ 6.54	\$ 392.60
36	5	Drum	\$ 823.90	\$ 4,943.40	\$ 877.25	\$ 4,386.25	\$ 1,025.42	\$ 5,127.10	*	\$ 1,104.36	\$ 5,521.78
Transmission Fluid General Motors Approved											
37	60	Quart	\$ 4.67	\$ 280.20	\$ 6.13	\$ 367.80	\$ 6.00	\$ 360.00	*	\$ 6.54	\$ 392.60
38	5	Drum	\$ 823.90	\$ 4,943.40	\$ 877.25	\$ 4,386.25	\$ 1,025.42	\$ 5,127.10	*	\$ 1,104.36	\$ 5,521.78
Transmission Fluid TES-295 Synthetic Allison											
39	10	Pail	\$ 122.75	\$ 1,227.50	\$ 177.85	\$ 1,778.50	\$ 248.00	\$ 2,480.00	*	\$ 192.30	\$ 1,922.96
40	5	Drum	\$ 800.25	\$ 4,001.25	\$ 1,838.65	\$ 9,193.25	\$ 2,127.95	\$ 10,639.75	*	\$ 1,676.12	\$ 8,380.58
Transmission Fluid Universal for Tractors											
41	5	Drum	\$ 616.00	\$ 3,080.00	\$ 770.00	\$ 3,850.00	\$ 905.80	\$ 4,529.00	*	\$ 675.07	\$ 3,375.37
42	100	Bulk	\$ 10.05	\$ 1,005.00	\$ 13.70	\$ 1,370.00	\$ 15.97	\$ 1,597.00	*	\$ 14.54	\$ 1,453.92

RFB 2022-192 Annual Contract for Oil and Lubricants

			Douglass Distributing Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Senergy Petroleum Phoenix, AZ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Brenntag Lubricants, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		The Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		
Item No.	Annual Est. Usage	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
Section 1: Oil and Lubricants			<b>Primary Award</b>		<i>Secondary Award</i>		Alternate Award				
Transmission Fluid TO-4 10W											
43	5	Pail	\$ 63.75	\$ 318.75	\$ 79.40	\$ 397.00	\$ 138.40	\$ 692.00	*	\$ 103.99	\$ 519.97
44	5	Drum	\$ 673.20	\$ 3,366.00	\$ 856.90	\$ 4,284.50	\$ 1,330.45	\$ 6,652.25	*	\$ 778.61	\$ 3,893.05
Transmission Fluid TO-4 30W											
45	5	Pail	\$ 67.80	\$ 339.00	\$ 79.40	\$ 397.00	\$ 138.40	\$ 692.00	*	\$ 103.22	\$ 516.08
46	10	Drum	\$ 745.80	\$ 7,458.00	\$ 856.90	\$ 8,569.00	\$ 1,330.45	\$ 13,304.50	*	\$ 815.67	\$ 8,156.72
Section 1 Total:			\$ 85,770.02		\$ 106,957.86		\$ 120,858.74		*	\$ 87,014.60	

RFB 2022-192 Annual Contract for Oil and Lubricants

			Douglass Distributing Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Senergy Petroleum Phoenix, AZ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Brenntag Lubricants, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		The Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	
Item No.	Annual Est. Usage	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 2: Chemicals & Solvents			<i>Secondary Award</i>		<i>Alternate Award</i>				<b>Primary Award</b>	
Antifreeze for Auto & Light Truck										
47	1	Gallon	\$ 8.04	\$ 8.04	\$ 9.51	\$ 9.51	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.20
48	1	Drum	\$ 481.25	\$ 481.25	\$ 506.00	\$ 506.00	\$ 534.33	\$ 534.33	\$ 386.45	\$ 386.45
Antifreeze for Heavy Duty Truck and Heavy Equipment										
49	1	Gallon	\$ 10.21	\$ 10.21	\$ 10.77	\$ 10.77	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.89	\$ 10.89
50	1	Drum	\$ 600.60	\$ 600.60	\$ 565.41	\$ 565.41	\$ 495.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 502.74	\$ 502.74
Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)										
51	12.5	Gallon	\$ 4.10	\$ 51.25	\$ 4.90	\$ 61.25	\$ 4.50	\$ 56.25	\$ 13.58	\$ 169.73
52	26	Drum	\$ 200.75	\$ 5,219.50	\$ 219.45	\$ 5,705.70	\$ 206.25	\$ 5,362.50	\$ 138.07	\$ 3,589.91
Naphtha										
53	1	Pail	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 47.50	\$ 47.50	\$ 94.30	\$ 94.30	\$ 88.93	\$ 88.98
54	1	Drum	\$ 389.40	\$ 389.40	\$ 492.80	\$ 492.80	\$ 927.25	\$ 927.25	\$ 638.31	\$ 638.31
Section 2 Total:			\$ 6,810.25		\$ 7,398.94		\$ 7,489.63		\$ 5,393.21	
Discount From List for Products Not Listed:			10%		10%		30%		0%	

Notes: \*The Bargain Source did not meet specificaitons for Section 1 for failure to bid all items as required.