
Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Daily Rental 12  $                      75.00  $                    900.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 12 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 12 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    450.00  $                    450.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 20  $                 1,800.00  $               36,000.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 20 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 20 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      75.00  $                      75.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 2  $                    450.00  $                    900.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 2 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 2 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,800.00  $                 1,800.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Section 1: Mini Van, 7-Passenger with Stow 
Away Seats or Seats Removed

Section Total  $                                                   37,350.00 

Section Total  $                                                     2,775.00 
Make/Model Offered Dodge Grand Caravan

Make/Model Offered Dodge Grand Caravan
Section 2: Mini Van, 7-Passenger with Rear 
Seats



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Daily Liability Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Weekly Rental 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Monthly Rental 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 

Daily Rental 1  $                    125.00  $                    125.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    750.00  $                    750.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 3,000.00  $                 3,000.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 4: Standard Van, 12-Passenger

Section 3: Full Size Van, 8-Passenger

Section Total  No Bid 

Section Total  $                                                     3,875.00 
Make/Model Offered Ford Transit, Chevrolet Express 

Passenger Van

Make/Model Offered  No Bid 



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                    125.00  $                    125.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    750.00  $                    750.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 3,000.00  $                 3,000.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      46.00  $                      46.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    275.00  $                    275.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,100.00  $                 1,100.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 5: Full Size Van, 15-Passenger

Section Total  $                                                     3,875.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,421.00 
Make/Model Offered Nissan NV200

Make/Model Offered Ford Transit, Chevrolet Express 
Passenger Van

Section 6: Mini Cargo Van



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      55.00  $                      55.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    330.00  $                    330.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,300.00  $                 1,300.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      82.00  $                      82.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    370.00  $                    370.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,500.00  $                 1,500.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 7: 1/2 Ton Cargo Van

Section Total  $                                                     1,685.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,952.00 
Make/Model Offered Ford Transit Cargo, Ram Promaster

Make/Model Offered Ford Transit Cargo, Ram Promaster

Section 8: 3/4 Ton Cargo Van



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      65.00  $                      65.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    390.00  $                    390.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,550.00  $                 1,550.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      67.00  $                      67.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    400.00  $                    400.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,600.00  $                 1,600.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 9: 3/4 Ton Cargo Van, Extended

Section Total  $                                                     2,005.00 

Section Total  $                                                     2,067.00 
Make/Model Offered Nissan Rogue, Jeep Cherokee

Make/Model Offered Chevrolet Express Extended Cargo

Section 10: Intermediate SUV



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      75.00  $                      75.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    450.00  $                    450.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,800.00  $                 1,800.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                 1,100.00  $                 1,100.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    660.00  $                    660.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 2,640.00  $                 2,640.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 11: Standard SUV

Section Total  $                                                     2,325.00 

Section Total  $                                                     4,400.00 
Make/Model Offered Chevrolet Tahoe, Ford Expedition, Nissan 

Armada

Make/Model Offered Ford Explorer, Chevrolet Equinox

Section 12: Large SUV



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      50.00  $                      50.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    300.00  $                    300.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,200.00  $                 1,200.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      46.00  $                      46.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    275.00  $                    275.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,100.00  $                 1,100.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 13: Full Size Sedan, 4-Door

Section Total  $                                                     1,550.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,421.00 
Make/Model Offered Volkswagen Jetta

Make/Model Offered Toyota Camry, Chevrolet Malibu, Nissan 
Altima

Section 14: Standard Sedan, 4-Door



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      50.00  $                      50.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    300.00  $                    300.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,200.00  $                 1,200.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      46.00  $                      46.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    275.00  $                    275.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,100.00  $                 1,100.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 15: Standard Hybrid Sedan, 4-Door

Section Total  $                                                     1,550.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,421.00 
Make/Model Offered Toyota Corolla, Nissan Sentra

Make/Model Offered Hyundai Sonata Hybrid

Section 16: Intermediate Sedan, 4-Door



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      55.00  $                      55.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    330.00  $                    330.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,300.00  $                 1,300.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      55.00  $                      55.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    330.00  $                    330.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,300.00  $                 1,300.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 17: Small Pickup Truck, Regular Cab, 2 
WD

Section Total  $                                                     1,685.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,685.00 

Make/Model Offered Nissan Frontier, Chevrolet Colorado, Ford 
Ranger

Make/Model Offered Nissan Frontier, Chevrolet Colorado, Ford 
Ranger

Section 18: Small Pickup Truck, Extended Cab, 
2 WD



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Daily Liability Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Weekly Rental 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Monthly Rental 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1  No Bid  No Bid 

Daily Rental 1  $                         58.00  $                         58.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                       350.00  $                       350.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                    1,400.00  $                    1,400.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 19: Small Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, 2 
WD, with Tow Hitch and 7-pin Trailer Connector

Section Total  No Bid 

Section Total  $                                                           1,808.00 

Make/Model Offered Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, Dodge 
Ram 1500

Make/Model Offered  No Bid 

Section 20: 1/2 Ton Pickup Truck, Regular Cab, 
2 WD



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      58.00  $                      58.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    350.00  $                    350.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,400.00  $                 1,400.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      58.00  $                      58.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    350.00  $                    350.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,400.00  $                 1,400.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 21: 1/2 Ton Pickup, Extended Cab, 2 
WD

Section Total  $                                                     1,808.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,808.00 

Make/Model Offered Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, 
Dodge Ram 1500

Make/Model Offered Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, 
Dodge Ram 1500

Section 22: 1/2 Ton Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, 2 
WD, with Tow Hitch and 7-pin Trailer Connector



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      63.00  $                      63.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    378.00  $                    378.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,500.00  $                 1,500.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      63.00  $                      63.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    378.00  $                    378.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,500.00  $                 1,500.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Section 23: 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Regular Cab, 
2 WD

Section Total  $                                                     1,941.00 

Section Total  $                                                     1,941.00 
Make/Model Offered Ford F-250, Dodge Ram 2500

Make/Model Offered Ford F-250, Dodge Ram 2500
Section 24: 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Extended 
Cab, 2 WD



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      63.00  $                      63.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    378.00  $                    378.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,500.00  $                 1,500.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                      75.00  $                      75.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    450.00  $                    450.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,800.00  $                 1,800.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Section Total  $                                                     2,325.00 
Make/Model Offered Ford F-350, Dodge Ram 3500

Make/Model Offered Ford F-250, Dodge Ram 2500
Section 26: One (1) Ton Pickup Truck, 
Extended Cab, 2 WD

Section 25: 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, 2 
WD

Section Total  $                                                     1,941.00 



Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price

 EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth 
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and 
Vans

 Award 

Daily Rental 1  $                      75.00  $                      75.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    450.00  $                    450.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 1,800.00  $                 1,800.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Daily Rental 1  $                    125.00  $                    125.00 
Daily Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly Rental 1  $                    750.00  $                    750.00 
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly Rental 1  $                 3,000.00  $                 3,000.00 
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Included Included

Car Rental
2832 W 7th
Fort Worth, TX

Truck Rental
2554 NE 28th St
Fort Worth, TX

Vehicle Pick-Up Location

Section Total  $                                                     3,875.00 

Make/Model Offered Premium SUV Chevrolet Suburban/GMC 
Yukon XL, Ford Expedition EL

Make/Model Offered Ford F-350, Dodge Ram 3500
Section 28: Other Vehicles Offered by Bidder

Section 27: One (1) Ton Pickup Truck, Crew 
Cab, 2 WD

Section Total  $                                                     2,325.00 

Notes: No bid received from Holt Cat. There is no award for Sections 3 and 19 because no bids 
were received.
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