

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			AED Brands LLC Kennesaw, GA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Any Day CPR Training, LLC McKinney, TX HUB - Yes		Cardio Partners, Inc. Brentwood, TN HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Con10gency Consulting LLC Selma, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Qty	Price		Price		Price		Price	
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$	330.00	\$	469.00	S	\$	306.38	No Bid
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 25	\$	325.00	\$	466.60	S	\$	304.24	No Bid
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 25	\$	102.00	\$	137.20	S	\$	95.38	No Bid
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 100	\$	38.00	\$	104.00	S	\$	35.06	No Bid
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 6	\$	96.00	\$	465.20	S	\$	89.25	No Bid
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 100	\$	70.00	\$	120.00	S	\$	65.63	No Bid
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$	227.00	\$	299.40	S	\$	212.63	No Bid
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	\$	1,610.00	\$	1,920.00	S	\$	1,345.00	No Bid
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	\$	110.00	\$	223.80	S	\$	105.88	No Bid
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$	345.00	\$	405.00		\$	306.25	No Bid

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			GoRescue Brands, Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	M-Pak, Inc. Aledo, TX HUB - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	QuadMed, Inc. Jacksonville, FL HUB - No
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price	Price
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$ 368.00	\$ 372.50	P \$ 281.86	\$ 393.29
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 25	\$ 368.00	\$ 356.18	P \$ 279.89	No Bid
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 25	\$ 107.00	\$ 98.65	P \$ 87.74	\$ 102.58
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 100	\$ 65.00	\$ 44.38	P \$ 32.25	\$ 50.30
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 6	\$ 103.00	\$ 94.13	P \$ 82.11	\$ 93.29
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 100	\$ 83.00	\$ 68.25	P \$ 60.37	\$ 68.59
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$ 217.00	\$ 217.85	P \$ 195.61	\$ 222.25
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	\$ 1,488.00	\$ 1,685.35	P \$ 1,299.00	No Bid
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	\$ 117.00	\$ 109.16	P \$ 97.40	No Bid
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	S \$ 302.00	\$ 309.16	P \$ 273.41	No Bid

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No		Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Uncharted Territory LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Qty	Price		Price		Price	
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$	334.57	No Bid	*	\$	60.00
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 25	\$	351.46	No Bid		\$	450.00
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 25	\$	101.17	No Bid		\$	120.00
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 100	\$	43.77	No Bid		\$	65.00
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 6	\$	95.36	No Bid		\$	115.00
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 100	\$	70.58	No Bid		\$	85.00
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$	215.47	No Bid		\$	260.00
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	No Bid		No Bid		\$	1,995.00
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	\$	124.65	No Bid		\$	175.00
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$	352.14	No Bid	*	\$	175.00

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			AED Brands LLC Kennesaw, GA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Any Day CPR Training, LLC McKinney, TX HUB - Yes		Cardio Partners, Inc. Brentwood, TN HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Con10gency Consulting LLC Selma, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Qty	Price		Price		Price		Price	
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2		\$ 101.00		\$ 116.80	S	\$ 87.73		No Bid
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2		\$ 392.00		\$ 440.20		\$ 344.75		No Bid
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2		\$ 157.00		\$ 227.20	S	\$ 139.13		No Bid
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	S	\$ 57.00		\$ 153.60	P	\$ 50.25		No Bid
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 3	S	\$ 17.95		\$ 152.80	P	\$ 8.95		No Bid
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 5	S	\$ 160.00		\$ 323.40	P	\$ 100.00		No Bid
17	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	*	\$ 0.00		\$ 3.00	S	\$ 1.00		No Bid
		Alternate				Per Spec		Cardio Partners CPCT		

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			GoRescue Brands, Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	M-Pak, Inc. Aledo, TX HUB - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	QuadMed, Inc. Jacksonville, FL HUB - No	
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price	Price	
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$ 117.00	\$ 97.59	P	\$ 80.70	\$ 110.67
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	\$ 337.00	\$ 347.65	S	\$ 333.50	No Bid
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	\$ 148.00	\$ 140.12	P	\$ 127.99	No Bid
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	\$ 73.00	\$ 97.58		\$ 69.00	No Bid
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 3	\$ 72.00	\$ 59.16		\$ 28.84	No Bid
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 5	\$ 257.00	\$ 248.65		\$ 219.76	No Bid
17	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$ 1.49	\$ 2.75	P	\$ 0.63	No Bid
		Alternate	Cubix 1TAG	Cubix 1-TAG		One Beat CPR Learning Center Tag-OBC	

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No		Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Uncharted Territory LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Qty	Price		Price		Price	
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$	109.10	No Bid		\$	175.00
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	\$	370.44	No Bid	P	\$	275.00
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	\$	161.55	No Bid		\$	165.00
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	\$	63.41	No Bid		\$	160.00
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 3	\$	56.91	No Bid		\$	40.00
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 5	\$	274.06	No Bid		\$	240.00
17	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$	1.49	No Bid		No Bid	
		Alternate	Good-lite 185728					

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award S - Secondary Award		AED Brands LLC Kennesaw, GA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Any Day CPR Training, LLC McKinney, TX HUB - Yes		Cardio Partners, Inc. Brentwood, TN HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Con10gency Consulting LLC Selma, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price	
18	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$ 15.00	\$ 24.95	P	\$ 7.95	No Bid		
		Alternate	Philips M3858A	Per Spec		Cardio Partners CPAEDTRISI GN			
19	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2 *	\$ 0.00	\$ 4.99	P	\$ 1.00	No Bid		
		Alternate		Per Spec		Cardio Partners CPDECAL- SM			
20	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved	0 - 10	\$ 45.00	\$ 175.00		\$ 39.95	P \$ 33.65		

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award S - Secondary Award		GoRescue Brands, Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	M-Pak, Inc. Aledo, TX HUB - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	QuadMed, Inc. Jacksonville, FL HUB - No	
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price	Price
18	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$ 15.00	\$ 14.95	S \$ 9.00	\$ 16.81
		Alternate	Cubix Flex3D	AMP AMP3858	One Beat CPR Learning Center OBC Wall Sign	DeFibtech DAC-230
19	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	\$ 1.49	\$ 2.05	S \$ 1.15	No Bid
		Alternate	Go Rescue AEDDECAL	DeFibtech DAC-803	One Beat CPR Learning Center AED Decal	
20	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved	0 - 10	No Bid	\$ 47.85	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.64

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	Uncharted Territory LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price
18	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$ 15.89	No Bid	No Bid
		Alternate	School Health CU-185723		
19	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	\$ 2.90	No Bid	No Bid
		Alternate	School Health CU-241264		
20	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved	0 - 10	\$ 48.79	S \$ 33.95	\$ 95.00

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

<p>P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i></p>		<p>AED Brands LLC Kennesaw, GA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes</p>	<p>Any Day CPR Training, LLC McKinney, TX HUB - Yes</p>	<p>Cardio Partners, Inc. Brentwood, TN HUB - No CO-OP - Yes</p>	<p>Con10gency Consulting LLC Selma, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes</p>
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price
20	North American Rescue #86-0405 or approved equal	Alternate	AED Brands ABF-91277	Stop the Bleed 64096	Curaplex 8600-STB001B
					Con10gency KIT-BCK- TARRANT

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			GoRescue Brands, Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		M-Pak, Inc. Aledo, TX HUB - Yes		One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		QuadMed, Inc. Jacksonville, FL HUB - No	
Item	Description	Qty	Price		Price		Price		Price	
20	North American Rescue #00-0403 or approved equal	Alternate			Per Spec		One Beat CPR Learning Center BK-OBC-BK1		Per Spec	

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.

RFB 2023-032 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P - Primary Award <i>S - Secondary Award</i>			School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes	Uncharted Territory LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Price	Price
20	North American Rescue #60-0405 or approved equal	Alternate	Per Spec	<i>Top Safety Products</i> <i>TSP#640-761</i>	Public Access Bc-stb1hs

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc. submitted a no-bid.

*Vendor withdrew bid for item due to pricing error.