

RFB 2023-040 Purchase of Padfoot Vibratory Compactors

<p>P = Primary Award</p>		<p>RDO Equipment Company Fort Worth, TX HUB - No</p>		<p>ASCO Equipment Euless, TX HUB - No</p>		<p>Romco Equipment Co, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No</p>	
		<p>Unit Price</p>		<p>Unit Price</p>		<p>Unit Price</p>	
<p>Item No.</p>	<p>Description</p>	<p>Est. Qty.</p>	<p>P \$ 153,000.00</p>	<p>\$ 173,100.00</p>	<p>\$ 177,895.00</p>		
<p>1</p>	<p>Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor, ROPS/FOBS with Strike Off Blade</p>	<p>1</p>					
<p>Brand/Model of Equipment Bid: 2023 Sakai SV544TB</p>							
<p>Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 60 - 180 Days</p>							
<p>Standard Manufacturer Warranty: 3 Yr/ 3,000 Hr, Full Machine</p>							
<p>2</p>	<p>Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor, with Cab and Strike Off Blade</p>	<p>1</p>	<p>P \$ 173,000.00</p>	<p>\$ 186,600.00</p>	<p>\$ 198,757.00</p>		
<p>Brand/Model of Equipment Bid: 2023 Sakai SV544TB</p>							
<p>Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 60 - 180 Days</p>							
<p>Standard Manufacturer Warranty: 3 Yr/ 3,000 Hr, Full Machine</p>							
<p>Optional Pricing:</p>							
<p>Extended Warranty Item 1:</p>		<p>\$</p>	<p>7,500.00</p>	<p>\$</p>	<p>2,050.00</p>	<p>\$</p>	<p>9,340.00</p>
<p>Terms:</p>		<p>5 Years/ 5,000 Hours</p>		<p>3 Yrs/ 2000 HR Power Train + Hydraulics + Electric</p>		<p>5 Yrs/ 5000 Hr Complete Machine</p>	
<p>Extended Warranty Item 2:</p>		<p>\$</p>	<p>7,500.00</p>	<p>\$</p>	<p>2,050.00</p>	<p>\$</p>	<p>9,340.00</p>
<p>Terms:</p>		<p>5 Years/ 5,000 Hours</p>		<p>3 Yrs/ 2000 HR Power Train + Hydraulics + Electric</p>		<p>5 Yrs/ 5000 Hr Complete Machine</p>	

RFB 2023-040 Purchase of Padfoot Vibratory Compactors

P = Primary Award		Bane Machinery Fort Worth, LP Fort Worth, TX HUB - No	R. B Everett & Co Haltom City, TX HUB - No	Kirby-Smith Machinery Fort Worth, TX HUB - No
Item No.	Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor, ROPS/FOBS with Strike Off Blade	\$ 194,847.00	\$ 205,479.00	No Bid
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid:		Dynapac CA3500PD HC	BOMAG BWZ11PDH-5	No Bid
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		150 -180 Days from Receipt of Order	210 Days	No Bid
Standard Manufacturer Warranty:		1 Yr/ 1,500 Hrs	1 Yr/ 1000 Hrs Full Machine	No Bid
2	Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor, with Cab and Strike Off Blade	\$ 210,100.00	\$ 217,822.00	\$ 269,985.00
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid:		Dynapac CA3500PD HC	BOMAG BWZ11PDH-5	Hamm HC160iP
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		150 -180 Days from Receipt of Order	210 Days	120 Days
Standard Manufacturer Warranty:		1 Yr/ 1,500 Hrs	1 Yr/ 1000 Hrs Full Machine	1 Year/ 1000 Hours
Optional Pricing:				
Extended Warranty Item 1:		\$ 5,215.00	\$ 2,980.00	\$ 4,500.00
Terms:		2 Yr/ 2000 Hr Extended Base Warranty	3 Yrs/ 3000 Hrs Bomag Premier Extended Warranty	EPG Premier 48/2500
Extended Warranty Item 2:		\$ 5,215.00	\$ 2,980.00	\$ 4,500.00
Terms:		2 Yr/ 2000 Hr Extended Base Warranty	3 Yrs/ 3000 Hrs Bomag Premier Extended Warranty	EPG Premier 48/2500

RFB 2023-040 Purchase of Padfoot Vibratory Compactors

P = Primary Award		Holt Texas, LTD Fort Worth, TX HUB - No	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price
1	Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor, ROPS/FOBS with Strike Off Blade	1	\$ 257,382.88
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid: Caterpillar CP56B			
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: Available Now			
Standard Manufacturer Warranty: 12 Months Total Machine			
2	Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor, with Cab and Strike Off Blade	1	\$ 277,392.26
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid: Caterpillar CP56B Cab			
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: October 2023			
Standard Manufacturer Warranty: 12 Months Total Machine			
Optional Pricing:			
Extended Warranty Item 1:		\$	1,350.00
Terms:			
Extended Warranty Item 2:		\$	1,350.00
Terms:			
		\$	4 yr/ 2000 Hrs Powertrain & Hydraulic Extended Warranty
		\$	4 yr/ 2000 Hrs Powertrain & Hydraulic Extended Warranty