

RFB 2023-043 Purchase of Full Size Pickup Trucks

P = Primary		Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No		Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No	
Item		Price		Price		Price	
1	2023 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Gasoline; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive	P	\$47,600.00		\$50,840.00	P	\$49,755.00
	Year		2023		2023		2023
	Make		Chev		RAM		Ford
	Model		CC20943		DJ2L92		W2A
	Engine		6.6L		6.4L		6.8L
	GVWR		10300		10000		10000
	Towing Capacity		18500		15050		12700
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		360		360
2	2023 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Diesel; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive	P	\$57,765.00		\$60,535.00		\$62,250.00
	Year		2023		2023		2023
	Make		Chev		RAM		Ford
	Model		CC20943		DJ2L92		W2A
	Engine		6.6L		6.7L		6.7L
	GVWR		11000		10000		10000
	Towing Capacity		18500		19980		12700
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		360		360

RFB 2023-043 Purchase of Full Size Pickup Trucks

		Sewell Family of Dealerships Odessa, TX HUB - No		Randall Reeds Planet Ford 635 Garland, TX HUB - No		Southwest CDJR LLC Cleburne, TX HUB - No	
Item		Price		Price		Price	
1	2023 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Gasoline; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive		\$52,250.00	P	\$45,800.00		No Bid
	Year		2023		2023		No Bid
	Make		Ford		Ford		No Bid
	Model		F250		F250		No Bid
	Engine		8		8		No Bid
	GVWR		10000		10000 GVWR		No Bid
	Towing Capacity				13,000		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		180		180-240		No Bid
2	2023 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Diesel; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive	P	\$52,250.00	P	\$54,880.00		No Bid
	Year		2023		2023		No Bid
	Make		Ford		Ford		No Bid
	Model		F250		F250		No Bid
	Engine		8				No Bid
	GVWR		10000		10000		
	Towing Capacity		No Bid		15000		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		180		180-240		No Bid

RFB 2023-043 Purchase of Full Size Pickup Trucks

P = Primary		Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No		Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No	
Item		Price		Price		Price	
3	2024 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Gasoline; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive		\$52,785.00		\$53,380.00		\$53,485.00
	Year		2024		2024		2024
	Make		Chev		RAM		Ford
	Model		CC20943		DJ2L92		W2A
	Engine		6.6L		6.4L		6.8L
	GVWR		10300		10000		10000
	Towing Capacity		18500		15050		12700
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		360		360

RFB 2023-043 Purchase of Full Size Pickup Trucks

		Sewell Family of Dealerships Odessa, TX HUB - No		Randall Reeds Planet Ford 635 Garland, TX HUB - No		Southwest CDJR LLC Cleburne, TX HUB - No	
Item		Price		Price		Price	
3	2024 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Gasoline; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive	P	\$52,250.00	P	\$48,250.00	P	\$52,215.00
	Year		2023		2023		2024
	Make		Ford		Ford		RAM
	Model		F250		F250		2500C/C
	Engine		8		8		6.4
	GVWR		10000		10000		8865
	Towing Capacity				13500		17450
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		180		180-240		250

RFB 2023-043 Purchase of Full Size Pickup Trucks

P = Primary		Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No		Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No	
Item		Price		Price		Price	
4	2024 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Diesel; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive		\$63,490.00		\$63,560.00		\$65,985.00
	Year		2024		2024		2024
	Make		Chev		RAM		Ford
	Model		CC20943		DJ2L92		W2A
	Engine		6.6L		6.7L		6.7L
	GVWR		11000		10000		10000
	Towing Capacity		18500		19980		12700
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		360		360

Notes: No bid was received from Grapevine DCJ, LLC

RFB 2023-043 Purchase of Full Size Pickup Trucks

		Sewell Family of Dealerships Odessa, TX HUB - No		Randall Reeds Planet Ford 635 Garland, TX HUB - No		Southwest CDJR LLC Cleburne, TX HUB - No	
Item		Price		Price		Price	
4	2024 Full-Size; Three Qtr. Ton; Crew Cab; Diesel; 8 Cylinder; Long Bed (8ft.); Two Wheel Drive	P	\$52,250.00	P	\$57,350.00	P	\$61,710.00
	Year		2023		2023		2024
	Make		Ford		Ford		RAM
	Model		F250		F250		2500C/C
	Engine		8		8		6.7
	GVWR		10000		10000		10000
	Towing Capacity				15000		20000
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		180		180-240		250

Notes: No bid was received from Grapevine DCJ, LLC