

RFB 2023-050 Purchase of Skid Steer and Compact Track Loader

P = Primary Award		Clark Equipment Company West Fargo, ND HUB - No	Holt Texas, LTD Fort Worth, TX HUB - No	Coufal-Prater Equipment LLC dba United Ag & Turf Waco, TX HUB - No	ASCO Equipment Eules, TX HUB - No
Item No.	Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Skid Steer Loader	P \$ 49,040.01	\$ 51,896.93	*\$56,300.00	\$ 54,620.00
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid:		Bobcat S62	Caterpillar 232D3	John Deere 318G	CASE SV185B
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		120 Days ARO	7 Months	100 Days	January 2023
Standard Manufacturer Warranty:		2 Yr / 2000 Hours	2 Yr/ 2000 Hour Total Machine	2 Yr / 2000 Hours	2 Yr / 2000 Hours
2	Compact Track Loader	P \$ 99,573.88	\$ 102,988.55	\$103,000.00	*\$74,410.00
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid:		Bobcat T86	Caterpillar 299D3 XPS	John Deere 331G	CASE TR340B
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		120 Days ARO	7 Months	100 Days	January 2023
Standard Manufacturer Warranty:		2 Yr / 2000 Hours	2 Yr/ 2000 Hour Total Machine	2 Yr / 2000 Hours	2 Yr / 2000 Hours
3	Skid Steer Loader with High Flow Hydraulics	*\$60,019.61	P \$ 65,509.53	*\$71,600.00	*\$56,400.00
Brand/Model of Equipment Bid:		Bobcat S76	Caterpillar 262D3 XPS	John Deere 324G	CASE SV280B
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		120 Days ARO	7 Months	100 Days	March 2023
Standard Manufacturer Warranty:		2 Yr / 2000 Hours	2 Yr/ 2000 Hour Total Machine	2 Yr / 2000 Hours	2 Yr / 2000 Hours
Optional Pricing					
A	Cold Planer 12 Inch, Standard Flow	\$ 14,312.72	No Bid	\$ 15,300.00	\$ 1,350.00
B	Cold Planer 18 Inch, Standard Flow	\$ 20,571.06	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 24,300.00	\$ 18,500.00
C	Auger, Rock Bit 6 Inch	\$ 1,335.62	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 950.00
D	Auger, Rock Bit 9 Inch	\$ 1,537.62	No Bid	\$ 4,185.00	\$ 1,200.00
E	Auger, Rock Bit 12 Inch	\$ 1,615.15	No Bid	\$ 4,310.00	\$ 1,400.00
F	Auger, Dirt Bit 6 Inch	\$ 810.26	No Bid	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 350.00
G	Auger, Dirt Bit 9 Inch	\$ 925.99	No Bid	\$ 3,400.00	\$ 470.00
H	Auger, Dirt Bit 12 Inch	\$ 1,169.93	No Bid	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 540.00
I	Grapple, Brush Style 72 Inch	\$ 4,584.64	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 6,075.00	\$ 5,600.00
J	Grapple, Brush Style 84 Inch	\$ 5,439.90	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 7,100.00	\$ 6,200.00
K	Angle Broom, 72 Inch	\$ 6,709.70	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 9,100.00	\$ 7,000.00
L	Angle Broom, 84 Inch	\$ 7,657.22	No Bid	\$ 9,350.00	\$ 7,800.00

RFB 2023-050 Purchase of Skid Steer and Compact Track Loader

P = Primary Award		Clark Equipment Company West Fargo, ND HUB - No	Holt Texas, LTD Fort Worth, TX HUB - No	Coufal-Prater Equipment LLC dba United Ag & Turf Waco, TX HUB - No	ASCO Equipment Euless, TX HUB - No
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
M	Angle Broom, 96 Inch	1	No Bid	\$ 9,600.00	\$ 8,600.00
N	Price of Extended Warranty for Skid Steer Loader	1	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,450.00
Terms:			48 Months or 3000 Hour Powertrain	4 Yr or 3000 Hours	3 Yr/ 2000 Hours
O	Price of Extended Warranty for Compact Track Loader	1	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 930.00	\$ 2,500.00
Terms:			48 Months or 3000 Hour Powertrain	4 Yr or 3000 Hours	3 Yr/ 2000 Hours
P	Price of Extended Warranty for Skid Steer Loader with High Flow Hydraulics	1	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 490.00	\$ 4,800.00
Terms:			48 Months or 3000 Hour Powertrain	4 Yr or 3000 Hours	3 Yr/ 2000 Hours
Discount off List for Items Not Listed:		20%	0%	5%	25%

Notes:

*Clark Equipment Company did not meet specifications for item 3 due to failure to bid required minimum bucket breakout force of 7,300 lbs. and offer a high flow auxiliary hydraulic system with flow of 32 GPM as required.

Coufal-Prater Equipment LLC d/b/a United Ag & Turf did not meet specifications for item 1 for failure to offer a required minimum auxiliary flow of 18 GPM, a relief valve setting of 3,000 PSI, and a travel speed gauge; and for item 3 for failure to offer a required minimum tipping capacity of 5,400 lbs. without counterweights, a minimum auxiliary flow of 32 GPM, a relief valve setting of 3,300 PSI, a 12-volt electrical system with an 80-amp alternator minimum, and a travel speed gauge.

ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for item 2 for failure to bid a required operating weight of 11,000 lbs.; for item 3 for failure to bid a required minimum operating capacity with counterweight of 2,900 lbs., a minimum auxiliary flow of 32 GPM, and a relief valve setting of 3,300 PSI and maximum 3,400 PSI.